
Sunbelt Opens New Business Brokerage Office
in Sacramento
Kevin Pickolick is now offering Sunbelt's brokerage services in California's State Capitol area.

INDEPENDENCE, OH, UNITED STATES, March 4, 2014 /EINPresswire.com/ -- Sunbelt®, the place
to go to buy or sell a business®, warmly welcomes Kevin Pickolick to the network. Pickolick has
recently opened a new Sunbelt office and will be working with general business clients in the greater
Sacramento County region while simultaneously developing his niche expertise in the senior care
market.


Pickolick joins Sunbelt with an extensive business and financial background in real estate, senior care
services and medical transportation. He has been a successful entrepreneur in the Sacramento area
for over twenty years and also served as a key player in land and tourism development in La Paz, the
capitol of Baja California Sur, Mexico.  


Pickolick stated, “The Sacramento region has experienced strong population and steady job growth
over the last few decades and is expected to outpace the national average by more than double over
the next ten years. For business owners, the region offers lower costs, a positive business climate and
a high quality of living. The recent influx of technology companies to the Sacramento area speaks to
the competitive business advantages of the region. I’m delighted to be providing Sunbelt’s brokerage
services to the Sacramento business community.”


“We are very pleased that Kevin Pickolick is now offering Sunbelt’s brokerage services in California’s
State Capitol area. The region is booming with opportunities and Kevin can provide his clients with a
wealth of hands-on experience of the local business climate and community. Partially in thanks to his
diverse business background and added expertise in the senior care segment, Kevin is a welcome
addition to the Sunbelt network,” added Kelci Cotter, Brand Manager for Sunbelt.


The new Sunbelt of Sacramento office is located at 3045 65th Street, Suite 7, Sacramento, CA
95820. To learn more about how he can help or to schedule a free, no-obligation consultation, please
contact Kevin Pickolick at 916-304-2272 or kevin.pickolick@sunbeltnetwork.com or visit his website:
sacramento.sunbeltnetwork.com.


About Sunbelt

Sunbelt® is the premiere network of franchised business brokerage offices in the world.  On any
given day, we have 10,000 small and medium-sized businesses listed for sale across our network.
The asking prices for these businesses typically range from $50,000 USD to $10,000,000 USD, with
an average of $600,000 USD.  With nearly 250 locations in North America, Europe, Asia, South Africa
and Australia, no other business brokerage can match Sunbelt’s geographic coverage, visibility to
buyers and business sales experience.  Because each office is independently owned and operated,
the global reach of the Sunbelt network is balanced with intensive local knowledge and involvement in
the business communities in which we operate.  Simply put, Sunbelt is the place to go to buy or sell a
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business®.  To learn more, visit www.sunbeltnetwork.com.
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