
Leading Medical Software Provider MediPro,
Inc. Celebrates 20-Year Anniversary
The company driven by an expansive vision for affordable medical software completes two decades in
the industry.

KENNESAW, GA, USA, December 17, 2015 /EINPresswire.com/ -- Medical software solutions
company MediPro, Inc., is pleased to be celebrating its 20th year of offering the finest electronic
medical records (EMR), medical billing and practice management software in the medical industry.
Founded two decades ago with President Marc Beck’s entrepreneurial spirit and desire to branch out
from his clearinghouse job, MediPro, Inc., dove into the healthcare marketplace with an expansive
vision to offer affordable medical software for revenue cycle management and eventually, electronic
health records.


"I can still remember the first employee who worked alongside me to help lay the foundation of being
a multi-faceted resource with fair prices and superior service," Beck stated. MediPro’s growth was in
line for a new startup company; however, word began spreading through physician and medical billing
networks that this company was the place to purchase market-proven billing software, which provided
medical professionals with a positive return on their investment. 


As the pace of daily operations began picking up, so too did the need for creating a fantastic team of
employees. Beck was discriminating with his new-hire decisions and set the bar high when it came to
the level of service MediPro provided to end users. Soon thereafter, MediPro began onboarding new
product opportunities, from clearinghouses to backup services. Before electronic health records
evolved from the market, MediPro was already deeply vested working with practices nationwide to
automate their patient flow creating a full front-to-back office solution. Forward-thinking medical
offices quickly aligned themselves with the healthcare technology MediPro offered.


Today, MediPro continues to shift gears to accommodate the demand of specialty medical offerings
and physician needs. "Our company truly enjoys developing solid working relationships with our client
base.  We want to provide a positive impact of changing lives from both a medical staff perspective
and patient experience," Beck said.  


MediPro’s primary goal remains the same as it did in the early days: giving clients a successful
software launch, with each practice maximizing the benefits of an enhanced technology infrastructure.
One of MediPro’s long-term clients said it best: "After a 13-year partnership, the team at MediPro
continues to amaze me with their dedication to service, cost-conscious product offerings and scope of
knowledge within the healthcare industry.  Outstanding and wonderful are the first two words that
come to mind when I describe my experience.  If you are looking for a company that truly cares about
the success of your practice, I would encourage you to contact them." 


Even in its 20th year, the team at MediPro continues to push the boundaries of medical software, ever
improving its cloud- and server-based products and services. It remains dedicated and focused on
helping healthcare professionals throughout the sales process, implementation, project management,
training and technical support phases.


http://www.einpresswire.com


###


About MediPro, Inc.

MediPro, Inc. is an award-winning medical billing software company offering practice management
systems and electronic health record solutions. MediPro’s mission is to deliver and support integrated
technology to the healthcare community. MediPro recognizes the need for a comprehensive,
interactive and cost-effective suite of applications that are customized to address the specific
requirements of healthcare offices.
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