
IFIP President to Open Sri Lanka’s Biggest Ever
ICT Conference
Mike Hinchey, President of IFIP, the global federation of ICT professional associations, will formally
open the combined NITC/SEARCC Conference in Sri Lanka.

COLOMBO, SRI LANKA, August 30, 2017 /EINPresswire.com/ -- Combined NITC/SEARCC
Conference to Attract Over 1,000 ICT Professionals 


Wednesday 30 August 2017 –  Mike Hinchey, President of IFIP, the global federation of ICT
professional associations, will formally open the combined NITC/SEARCC Conference in Sri Lanka
next month. 


Professor Hinchey will discuss the critical role ICT professionals play in enhancing the quality of life
for people around the world by developing and applying new and disruptive technologies like Artificial
Intelligence, Robotics, Machine Learning, Cloud Computing, Big Data, the Internet of Things and
Mobile Computing. 


As head of IFIP, Hinchey is a champion for ICT professional standards and says the conference
theme, “Towards Digital Prosperity” speaks directly to IFIP’s own commitment to advance professional
and socially responsible ICT worldwide for the benefit of all people.


“I congratulate CSSL (Computer Society of Sri Lanka) on its outward-looking vision,” he said. “By
inviting both IFIP and SEARCC to play an active role in NITC, CSSL has opened Sri Lanka’s doors to
the world, bringing a wealth of ICT expertise and thought leadership to Colombo and creating an
unprecedented opportunity for international relationship building and information sharing.”


In his opening remarks, Professor Hinchey will also remind delegates of their responsibility to act
ethically in relation to the technology they develop, highlighting increased uncertainty for workers as
more jobs become automated, and the significant and growing threats from cybercriminals.


“Ultimately, the power is in the hands of those who best understand how to design, build and maintain
our ICT systems – the ICT practitioners and professionals who make up our member societies. Each
has a clear responsibility to act professionally and ethically in all that you do.  That means building
quality systems that deliver the capability your clients have been promised, while ensuring that your
solutions are socially responsible in supporting the needs and well-being of end users.”


Professor Hinchey will also point to IFIP’s collaborations with the United Nations, UNESCO and ITU
which seek to progress the UN’s Sustainable Development Goals, particularly those relating to:


•	Good health and well-being;

•	Quality education;

•	Clean water and sanitation;

•	Affordable and clean energy;

•	Decent work and economic growth;

•	Industry, innovation and infrastructure;


http://www.einpresswire.com
http://ifipnews.org


•	Reduced inequalities; and

•	Sustainable cities and communities.


“We believe that technology and the ICT professionals who create, develop, and implement that
technology can play a significant role in enhancing the quality of life for people in both developed and
developing nations,” Professor Hinchey said.


The NITC/SEARCC Conference will be held in Colombo from 14-15 September, preceded by three
days of invitation-only meetings for the IFIP General Assembly, its various committees and SEARCC
Executive Committee.


International speakers include:

•	President of SEARCC and Adjunct Professor at the University of Queensland, Dr Nick Tate;

•	Vice President of the British Computer Society, Professor Tom Crick of Cardiff Metropolitan
University;

•	IFIP IP3 Chair and former Australian Computer Society President, Brenda Aynsley;

•	IFIP Vice President, Dr Yuko Murayama of Japan;

•	Dr Gabriela Marin Raventos of the University of Costa Rica; 

•	Professor Kai Rannenberg of Goethe University in Frankfurt, and many more. 


For more information, including how to register for the event, visit https://www.cssl.lk/ 


ENDS


About IFIP

IFIP, the International Federation for Information Processing, is the global professional federation of
societies and associations for people working in Information and Communications Technologies and
Sciences. Established under the auspices of UNESCO in 1960 and recognised by the United Nations,
IFIP represents ICT professional associations from more than 50 countries and regions with a total
membership of over half a million. It also brings together more than 3,500 scientists from industry and
academia, organising them into over 100 Working Groups and 13 Technical Committees to conduct
research, develop standards and promote information sharing. Based in Austria, IFIP organises and
supports over 100 conferences each year, fostering the distribution of research and knowledge to
academics and industry practitioners alike.


Website: http://ifip.org

Latest news: http://ifipnews.org

Twitter: http://twitter.com/ifipnews

LinkedIn:

https://www.linkedin.com/company/ifip---international-federation-for-information-processing
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