
Forget What SEO Used To Be....  Welcome to
the Premier SEO Program for 2018.
We are so confident in our Search Engine Keyword Ranking services that your business will be
ranking on page 1 of Google BEFORE you pay.

MECHANICSBURG, PA, USA, December 18, 2017 /EINPresswire.com/ -- Linda Donnelly Morris,
President and Owner of ForLawFirmsOnly.NET and Business Solutions Marketing Group LLC, a
Digital Marketing Agency that specializes in services for Law Firms announces the availability of a
“new” SEO program where you don’t pay ANYTHING until all of your keywords are on “Page One” of
Google.   Linda Donnelly stated. “The goal of SEO is to consistently place your business on Page
ONE of Google, using as many keywords as possible in order to drive targeted traffic to your company
website, giving you an incredible edge over the competition.”


Linda Donnelly Morris goes on to say that “Investing in organic SEO is more important now than ever
before, despite the current difficulty everyone finds themselves facing regarding the lack of rankings
for organic keyword data and associated traffic. Your business definitely needs to have an SEO
strategy in place if you are interested in succeeding in terms of online marketing; it remains one of the
single most important components of any organization’s branding efforts and online presence.”


ForLawFirmsOnly.NET is the future of Search Engine Keyword Ranking. Our turnkey system begins
with real experts who research keyword usage for your business and then advances with our
proprietary technology consistently keeping your business on page 1 of Google.


Unlike other SEO companies, we go after high-competition keywords because they have the most
traffic. The other SEO companies go after what they term “low hanging fruit” keywords that have
40,000 or less competing Web sites. Those “low hanging fruit” keywords have little to no traffic
associated with them.


Most of the clients that we work with have tried cheap SEO one or more times, you already know it
does not work very well, very often or for very long. Linda at ForLawFirmsOnly.NET feels like it’s time
to quit wasting time and money and go with a professional search engine ranking company where
EVERYONE gets on page 1 of Google for 30 or 50 keywords in less than 30 days AND you pay
NOTHING until you get those results.

Somewhere between 80-90% of customers now search online prior to making a purchase, and this
number is only expected to increase. It won’t be long before virtually everyone is searching for
products and services online. Do you want them to be able to locate your business, or not?  Without
organic SEO in place, people will have a very hard time finding you and will instead find your
competitors.


You only have two choices to get found on Google:


1.	Use one or two keywords and try for 4 to 6 months to get on page 1 of Google for low competition
keywords, with low traffic counts. It doesn’t always work, and when it does, the rankings often vanish
after a brief time.

2.	Get 30 or 50 keywords on page 1 of Google for high competition keywords with high traffic counts,

http://www.einpresswire.com
https://www.forlawfirmsonly.net/law-firm-seo


in LESS than 30 days, actually much less. 


You get all your rankings BEFORE you pay one cent.


These rankings do NOT disappear. We are the ONLY company offering choice #2.


If you'd like to discuss how you can benefit from potential clients in your area searching for your
specific service on the internet, then give us a call today so we can learn more about your business
and exactly what type of potential clients you are most interested in.


More About Business Solutions Marketing Group, LLC and ForLawFirmsOnly.NET 

Founded in 2011, ForLawFirmsOnly.NET has helped many Law Firms with local SEO marketing,
building Google Review Scores, Legal Fee Financing and Legal Live Chat services.  To learn more
about Business Solutions Marketing Group, LLC and ForLawFirmsOnly.NET you should call 800-322-
1339 or visit us at  www.ForLawFirmsOnly.NET

Linda Donnelly, President and CEO
ForLawFirmsOnly.NET
800-322-1339
email us here
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