
Rising Aged Population Augments the Global
Synthetic Biology Market
INDORE, INDIA, February 7, 2018 /EINPresswire.com/ -- Orion Market Research (OMR), recently
published a market research report on Global Synthetic Biology Market. According to OMR analysis,
the global synthetic biology market is expected to grow impressively during the forecast period (2017-
2022). Global synthetic biology market has witnessed a significant growth owing to increasing
research activities, innovative and advanced applications of synthetic biology, and so forth. The global
synthetic biology market is segmented on the basis of application, products, end users and
geography. The report provides detailed and insightful chapters on market overview, key findings,
strategic recommendations, market estimations, market determinants, sector analysis, key company
analysis, market insights, company profiling, market segmentation, geographical analysis, analyst
insights, and predictive analysis of the market. 


Full report of Global Synthetic Biology Market is available at https://www.omrglobal.com/industry-
reports/synthetic-biology-market/


Ageing population is growing considerably across the globe. According to WHO, between 2000 and
2050, the proportion of the world's population over 60 years will double from about 11% to 22%. The
absolute number of people aged 60 years and over is expected to increase from 605 million to 2
billion over the same period. The number of people aged 80 years or above will have almost
quadrupled between 2000 and 2050 to 395 million. According to UN (United Nations Org), over the
next 15 years, the number of older persons is expected to grow fastest in the Caribbean and Latin
America with a projected 71% increase in the population aged 60 years or over. Other regions with
growing older populations includes Asian (66%), Africa (64%), Oceania (47%), Northern America
(41%) and Europe (23%). Elderly population is more prone to chronic diseases, and synthetic biology
opens the way for tailoring treatments by developing new drugs and vaccines.


Geographically the global synthetic biology Market is segmented into North America, Europe, Asia-
Pacific (APAC) and Rest of the World (RoW). North America has the highest market share owing to
increased aging population and rising prevalence of chronic diseases in the region. APAC is growing
at a highest rate majorly due to aging population, increasing prevalence of chronic diseases and
growing awareness among innovative and advanced applications of genetically modified products. 


Key Companies Profiled in the Report-

•	Algenol Biofuels

•	Autolus

•	BASF SE

•	Bioamber

•	Lgc Biosearch Technologies, Inc.

•	Butamax Advanced Biofuels Ltd.

•	Codexis Inc.

•	DNA2.0, Inc.

•	Dupont

•	Editas Medicine, Inc.

•	Gen9 Inc.


http://www.einpresswire.com
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•	Genewiz, Inc.

•	Genscript Corporation

•	Ginkgo Bioworks

•	Intellia Therapeutics

•	Integrated Dna Technologies, Inc.

•	Origene Technologies, Inc.

•	Pareto Biotechnologies

•	Synthetic Genomics, Inc.

•	Synthorx, Inc.

•	Twist Bioscience

•	Vedanta Biosciences, Inc.


For related reports please visit https://www.omrglobal.com/reports-category/healthcare/


The report covers:

• Comprehensive research methodology of synthetic biology market

• In-depth analysis of macro and micro factors influencing the market guided by key recommendations

• Analysis of regional regulations and other government policies impacting the global Synthetic
biology market

• Insights about market determinants, which are stimulating the global Synthetic biology market

• Detailed and extensive market segments with regional distribution of forecasted revenues

• Extensive profiles and recent developments of market players


About Orion Market Research

Orion Market Research (OMR) is an Indian research company known for its crisp and concise
reports. The company is equipped with an experienced team and young brigade of analysts. The
company provides quality syndicated research reports, customized research reports, company
profiling, consulting and other research-based services. OMR provide global and regional market
reports of various domains such as healthcare, energy, IT, chemicals, and automobiles. The company
provides a 360-degree view of the market with parametric analysis, key market insights, key findings,
statistical forecasts, competitive landscape, extensive segmentation, key trends, strategic
recommendations and detailed company profiles.
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