
Research delivers insight into the Medical
Device Technologies market forecast to 2023
Medical Device Technologies provides a forward looking perspective on different factors driving or
restraining market growth

PUNE, MAHARASHTRA, INDIA, April 10, 2018 /EINPresswire.com/ -- Medical device can be defined
as an instrument, in-vitro reagent, implant or apparatus utilized to diagnose or treat a medical
condition. Technologies which are utilized in medical devices to perform the diagnosis and treatment
of medical conditions are called medical device technologies. Without aneffective technology medical
device is not able to work out efficiently for the diagnosis of a medical condition.


The evolution of Medical Device Technologies have led to breakthroughs in disease diagnosis and in
treatment of diseases. Medical technologies have brought about efficacy, sustainability, and efficiency
in healthcare systems with hi-tech devices such as ultrasounds, continuous glucose monitoring
systems, and many more. These are some of the key growth drivers of the medical device
technologies market.


Get Sample Copy of this report:

https://www.healthcareintelligencemarkets.com/request_sample.php?id=6317


Top Key vendors:

Abbott Laboratories, Boston Scientific Corporation, Baxter International Inc., Medtronic plc, Cardinal
Health Inc., F. Hoffmann-La Roche Ltd., GE Healthcare, Johnson & Johnson, Siemens Healthineers,
Smith & Nephew plc, Stryker Corporation, Koninklijke Philips N.V.


The global medical device technologies market has been studied in terms of device type, end-user,
and region. The segments of the market depending upon device type are in vitro diagnostics devices,
diagnostic imaging devices, cardiology devices, ophthalmology devices, orthopedic devices,
endoscopy devices, diabetes care devices, wound management devices, anesthesia and respiratory
care devices, kidney/dialysis devices, and other devices. The others segment comprises hospital
supply devices, dental devices, and drug delivery systems.


Investment in medical device technology research and development have surged in the recent past as
well as collaborations have led to recent advances including neuro-stimulators, stent technologies,
biomarkers, robotic assistance and implantable electronic devices.  Europe is the second largest
medical device technologies market due to increased geriatric population and government regulations
assisting the market growth. Asia-Pacific is considered as an emerging market owing to the
advancements in the technology and health care infrastructure. Japan, China and India are the fastest
growing economy. Rising population, changing lifestyle and acceptance to newer technology are the
factors which act as the market drivers in the region. South American countries such as Brazil and
Mexico are the regions that have significant potential for growth due to developing medical
infrastructure, and high disposable income.
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