
Translator Keyboard: Instant Translation
Connects You with the World
We want to make the Translator Keyboard, the most popular AI-enabled assistant, a context-savvy,
real-time universal language translator.

RIYADH, RIYADH , SAUDI ARABIA, April 20, 2018 /EINPresswire.com/ -- With the use of foreign
languages becoming more popular than ever before, the demands for instant translation keep growing
worldwide. Generally speaking, photographic translation, speech translation and other forms of
interpretation can satisfy almost everyone’s needs.


However, there is still a big pain point-- when chatting with someone in a foreign language, it always
annoys us when we can’t find the exact word to use since it is not our mother tongue. Because of
that, we have to switch between IM Apps and translation software from time to time. It is not only time-
consuming but also incredibly tedious. 


Admittedly, there are several applications on the market that seem to be able to solve this issue. But
from customer reviews on App Store, we know that almost all of these apps are crudely designed with
poor stability and worse user experience.


The Translator Keyboard is designed to solve this problem with an exclusive combination of
translation and keyboard together. With the world's leading Google Translation Engine and our
advanced keyboard development technology, we can guarantee the quality of reading as well as the
smoothness and stability of keyboard typing at the same time. The Translator Keyboard is committed
to developing the best solution to translation issues, helping people become confident and
comfortable when using foreign languages.


“We want to make the Translator Keyboard, the most popular AI-enabled assistant, a context-savvy,
real-time universal language translator,” the Product Manager, Xuan Liu said.


As you may see, we have already attracted attention from some of our keyboard users in Saudi
Arabia.


Check us out on Snapchat https://www.snapchat.com/add/keyboard_transl or Instagram
https://www.instagram.com/translator_keyboard/


For more information about how the Translator Keyboard can help you translate conversations into
more than 50 languages, check out: https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=k5ZitF6Rbok
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