
LifeStart Expands Their Presence in the
Northeast
JOHNSTON, RHODE ISLAND, UNITED STATES, August 22, 2018 /EINPresswire.com/ -- LifeStart , the
premium Corporate Fitness provider, today announced the opening of a new owner-occupied
site in Rhode Island, expanding their presence in the Northeast.

The fitness center features a comprehensive line of Life Fitness cardio equipment, with 21-inch
embedded displays that support HD-TV, Netflix, Hulu, Spotify and more. On-Demand
programming is provided through Peloton bikes and MyZone. The group exercise room will be
home to the industry’s best yoga, cycling, Pilates, Zumba and bootcamp instructors and classes.
The Life Fitness synergy 360 will be allow our degreed fitness professionals to coach group and
personal training sessions.

LifeStart's innovative approach to corporate fitness center management, including engaging
programming targeted at the entire employee population, integrated wellness services with the
onsite clinic and access to specialized health professionals, will help ensure that all employees
will have a healthy and fun workplace culture that continues to thrive.

About LifeStart Wellness Network

Founded in 1991, LifeStart provides premium corporate fitness solutions to established
companies and enterprises ranging from small business to Fortune 500 brands including
household names such as PepsiCo, Samsung, and Boars Head.  The company has seen
extraordinary growth in the past year, now operating nearly 80 sites in 13 states nationwide.
LifeStart has more than 27 years of experience in designing, developing and operating
hospitality-focused amenities for our nationwide customer base.  As a service-driven company
that believes in consistently delivering the best experience at work, our stunning, design-driven
centers and best-in-class services install a sense of pride in our customers and empower our
members to achieve their best each day.  To learn more about LifeStart, visit www.lifestart.net.
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This press release can be viewed online at: http://www.einpresswire.com

Disclaimer: If you have any questions regarding information in this press release please contact
the company listed in the press release. Please do not contact EIN Presswire. We will be unable
to assist you with your inquiry. EIN Presswire disclaims any content contained in these releases.
© 1995-2018 IPD Group, Inc. All Right Reserved.

http://www.einpresswire.com
http://www.lifestart.net
http://www.einpresswire.com/contact_author/2531172
http://www.einpresswire.com/

